BID TABULATICN
GRAVELLY VALLEY ROAD WATER LINE EXTENSION
FIRST UTILITY DISTRICT OF HAWKINS COUNTY

Bid Opening Name of Bidder:| Amarican Environmental, LLC Baker's (::onstructlon Glass Machinery & Excavation, GRC Construction Services | John T. Hall Construction, Inc Merkel _Bros. Mike Smith Pump Service, Mofield Brothers Morgan Coenfracting, Inc Norris 8ros., LLC
Time: 2:00 P . Services, Ing, Inc. . Construction, Inc. LLC Construction Co,, LLC y
il 5191 Sullivan Gardens Plovy 4533 Hwy 11E 27262 Wildsrness Rd 130 Regionat Park Dr 571 Turn Table Rd 1107 Myers St 3625 Huwy 25E 644 Lebanon Hwy 900 Dutchtown Rd 22 Northside Ln
Date: Cctober 27, 2020 i j i j
Place: 523 West Main Bivd, Church Hil, TN Kingsport, TH 37650 Bluff City, TN 37618 Jonesville, VA 74263 “ingspent, T 37660 Sparta, TN 38583 Greenevile, TN 37743 | Bean Station, TN 37708 Carthage, TN 37030 Knoxville, TN 37618 Crossville, TN 38571
.| Atlantic Specialty Insurance . Harlforg Accident and Indemnily Fhiladelphia Indemnity Insurance . United States Fire Insurance
Piymouth, MN 55441 ' Hartferd, CT 06155 Enier. Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004 NEs, Morristown, NI 07962
BASE BID
I:f;‘ Description Unit i::' Unit Price | Item Total |Unit Price | ttem Total | Unit Price Item Total Unit Price ftem Total Unit Price ltem Total |[Unit Price|Item Total | Unit Price | Item Total UnitPrice | Item Total |Unit Price | item Total | Unit Price | Item Total
1 |8 PVC Water Line (Class 200) LF 15,800 $40.00 $636,000.00 $21.28] $338,352.00 $24.00| $381,600.00 $28.00| $445,200.00 $23.00{ $365,700.00 519.00] $302,100.00 $49.00| $779,100.00)
2 [DIP Fittings LB 1,000 $5.15 $5,150.00 $10.80 $10,800.00 $2.52 $2,520.00 $17.50 $17,500.00 $2.70 $2,700.00 £8.00 58,000.00 $5.00]  $5,000.00
3 |Class B Concrete Encasement LF 20 $200.00 $4,000.00 $325.00 $6,500,00 $282.00 $5,640.00 $180.00 $3,600.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $60.00 $1,200.00 5120.00)  $2,400.00
4 [Cornect to Existing 8" PVC Water Ling EA 1 $5,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,638.00 $8,635.00) $7.039.00 $7,039.00]  $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $4,000.00 54,000.00|  $6,000.00 46,000.00 $4,000.00|  54,000.00)
5 |6 Gate Valve w/ Valve Box EA 9 $1,650.00 $14,850.00 $948.45 $8,636.05|  §1,338.00 $12,042.00|  $1,400.00 $12,600.00, $1,200.00] $10,800.00]  $1,500.00| $13,500.00 $1,500.00| $13,500.00
6 |Arr Release Valve Assembly EA 17 $1,800.00 $30,800.00 $851.61 $14,477.37 $1,098.00 $18,666.00 $1,400.00 $23,800.00 $1,000.00 $17,000.00 $1,600.00 $27,200,00 52,800.00| $47,600.00)
7  |Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 2 $5,200.00 $10,400.00 $3,852.00 $7.704.00 $5,635.00 $11,270.00]  $3,800,00 $7,600.00 $3,300.00 $7,600.00 $5.200.00]  $10,400.00 55,000.00| $10,000.00)
B8 [Asphalt Roadway Replacement LF 135 $110.00 $14,850.00 $51.05 $6,891.75 $33.00 $4,455.00 $43.00 55,805.00 $45.00) $6,075.00 $60.00 $8,100.00 $45.00|  $6,075.00)
9 [Asphall Drivaway Replacement LF 190 $105.00 $19,650.00 $38.10 $7,239.00 $33.00 $6,270.00 546.00 $8,740.00 $40.00 $7,600.00 $60.00|  $11,400.00 545.00(  $8,550.00)
10 jConcrete Driveway Replacement LF BO $240.00 $19,200.00 $56.65 $4,532.00 $76.00 $6,080.00 590.00 $7,200.00 550.00 $4,000.00 $60.00 $4,800.00 $45.00]  $3,600.00]
11 |Gravet Driveway Replacement LF 230 $50.00 $11,500.00 $13.20 $3,036.00 $22.00 $5,060.00 $10.00 $2,300.00 $15.00 $3,450.00 $35.00 $8,050.00 $20.00|  $4,600.00)
12 {Pump Station, Complete Installation LS 1 $71,100.00 $71,100.00 $69,200.00 $69,200.00] $61,583.00 $61,683.00] $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $220,000.00{ $220,000.00)
TOTAL BASE BID $843,600.00 NO BID $485,906.17 $522,225.00 $615,845.00 NO BID $489,925.00 $475,750.00 NO BID $1,104,425.00
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE
Ay |8 DIR Water Lina (Clase 250) in | LF | 15900 $15.00 | $238,500.00 $21.05 |$334,695.00 $16.00 |$254,400.00 $16.00| $254,400.00 * $16.50[* $262,350.00]  * $20.00|* $312,000.00 $52.00| $826,800.00
TOTAL BASE BID PLUS ADDITIVE ALTERNATE A-1 $1,082,100.00 NO BID $820,601.17 $776,625.00 $870,245.00 NO BID $752,275.00 $793,750.00 NO BID $1,931,225.00

* Math errar corrected.

| hereby certify that the abova is a true and accurate tabulation of bids received at 2:00 p.m. local
time on October 27, 2020, at the utility district offica, 523 West Main Boulevard, Church Hill, TN
37642, for the Gravelly Valley Road Water Line Extension Project for the First Ulility District of
Hawkins County.

By

David L. Jones, P
Tennessee License No.
CTI Engineers, nc.

112 Durwood Road, Suite A
Knoxville, TN 37922
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