

**BID TABULATION  
HIWASSEE UTILITIES COMMISSION  
2020 FACILITIES PAINTING PROJECT**

<b>Bid Opening</b> Time: 10:00 AM Date: May 28, 2020 Place: 3973 Chatata Valley Road, Charleston, TN 37310	<b>Name of Bidder:</b> <b>Mansfield Industrial, Inc.</b> 412 Lebanon Rd. NE, Cleveland, TN 37323	<b>Charlie Irwin Painting, LLC (CIP)</b> 104 Alpha Drive, Franklin, TN 37064	<b>Tech Coat, Inc.</b> 4310 Greenway Drive, Knoxville, TN 37918
	<b>Bid Bond:</b> Liberty Mutual Insurance Company 175 Berkeley Street, Boston, MA 02116	Pennsylvania National Mutual Casualty Insurance Company Two North Second Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101	


**BASE BID**

Item No.	Description	Unit	Est. No. of Units	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total
1	Repaint Main Building Pump Room, Pipe Gallery, Control Room, Laboratory, Restrooms, Kitchen, Hallways, Office, Entry Hall, Conference Room, and Electrical Control Room as specified.	LS	1	\$294,472.00	\$294,472.00	\$196,684.00	\$196,684.00		
2	Repaint Meter Station as specified.	LS	1	\$40,297.00	\$40,297.00	\$36,580.00	\$36,580.00		
3	Repaint Chemical Building Alum Room and Lime and Polymer Room as specified.	LS	1	\$14,329.00	\$14,329.00	\$12,340.00	\$12,340.00		
2	Repaint Interior of Hydropneumatic Tank with Paint System No. 1 as specified.	LS	1	\$28,902.00	\$28,902.00	\$18,702.00	\$18,702.00		
<b>TOTAL BASE BID</b>					<b>\$378,000.00</b>		<b>\$264,306.00</b>		<b>No Bid</b>

**DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATES**

D-1	Deduct for Overcoating Pump Room Piping in Item No. 1 (above) by Eliminating 3rd Coat of Series 971 of Coating System CS-4.	LS	1	\$3,392.00	\$3,392.00	\$14,000.00	\$14,000.00		
D-2	Deduct for Overcoating Pump Room Piping in Item No. 1 (above) with Coating System CS-7 in Lieu of Coating System CS-4.	LS	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$37,000.00	\$37,000.00		
D-3	Deduct for Repainting Interior Piping, Etc. in Item No. 2 (above) with Coating System CS-8 in Lieu of Coating System CS-5.	LS	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,000.00	\$9,000.00		
D-4*	Deduct Item No. 3 (Must Match Item No. 3 Unit Price)	LS	1	\$14,329.00	\$14,329.00	\$12,340.00	\$12,340.00		
D-5	Deducted Costs to Use Paint System No. 2 in Lieu of Paint System No. 1 in Item No. 4.	LS	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		

I hereby certify that the above is a true and accurate tabulation of bids received at 10:00 a.m. (Eastern) on Thursday, May 28, 2020, at Hiwassee Utilities Commission, 3973 Chatata Valley Road, Charleston, TN 37310 for the 2020 Facilities Painting Project.

By   
 John L. King, P.E., Project Manager  
 Tennessee License No. 103702  
 CTI Engineers, Inc.  
 112 Dunwood Road, Suite A  
 Knoxville, TN 37922