

BID TABULATION
WATER TREATMENT PLANT - 2018 CLEANING OF SLUDGE LAGOONS
DEPARTMENT OF WATER QUALITY CONTROL
CITY OF COOKEVILLE, TENNESSEE

Bid Opening Time: 2:00 PM Date: July 24, 2018 Place: Department of Water Quality Control, Cookeville, TN	Name of Bidder:	Slurry Systems Company, Inc. 330 Davis Rd. Lexington, TN 38351	Denali Water Solutions 3308 Bernice Ave., Russellville, AR 72802	Merit Construction, Inc. 10435 Dutchtown Road Knoxville, TN 37932	W&O Construction 150 Construction Drive, Livingston, TN 38570	Merrell Bros., Inc. 8811 West 500 North, Kokomo, IN 46901	Tradebe Environmental Services, LLC 1411 S Dickerson Rd., Goodlettsville, TN 37072
	Bid Bond:	Merchants National Bonding, Inc. P.O. Box 14498 Des Moines, IA 50306	Berkley Insurance Company 412 Mount Kemble Ave. Suite 310N Morristown, NJ 07960	Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America 1 Tower Square, Hartford, CT 06183	Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America 1 Tower Square, Hartford, CT 06183	The Guarantee Company of North America USA 1 Towne Square Suite 1470, Southfield, MI 48076	Atlantic Specialty Insurance Company 605 Hwy 169 N Suite 800 Plymouth, MN 55441

BASE BID - OPTION 1 CLEANING AND LANDFILL DISPOSAL

Item No.	Description	Unit	Est. No. of Units	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total
1	Mobilization and Installation of Storm Water Controls ¹	LS	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$23,750.00	\$23,750.00	\$34,042.00	\$34,042.00
2	Cleaning, Dewatering, Hauling, and Landfill Disposal of Contents of Sludge Lagoons	Dry Ton	1,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$690.00	\$1,311,000.00	\$585.00	\$1,111,500.00	\$687.00	\$1,305,300.00	\$715.80	\$1,360,020.00
3	Demobilization, Clean-up, and Restoration of Disturbed Areas ²	LS	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$29,000.00	\$29,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$18,750.00	\$18,750.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00
OPTION 1 - TOTAL BASE BID					No Bid	No Bid	\$1,400,000.00	\$1,231,500.00	\$1,347,800.00	\$1,419,062.00					


BASE BID - OPTION 2 CLEANING AND LAND APPLICATION

Item No.	Description	Unit	Est. No. of Units	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price	Item Total
1	Mobilization and Installation of Storm Water Controls ¹	LS	1	\$24,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$13,800.00	\$13,800.00	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Cleaning, Dewatering, Hauling, and Land Application of Contents of Sludge Lagoons	Dry Ton	1,900	\$240.00	\$456,000.00	\$391.35	\$743,565.00	\$570.00	\$1,083,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Demobilization, Clean-up, and Restoration of Disturbed Areas ²	LS	1	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$8,600.00	\$8,600.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
OPTION 2 - TOTAL BASE BID					\$480,000.00	\$765,965.00	\$1,153,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				

¹Lump sum bid shall not exceed 5 percent of total bid for the option.

²Lump sum bid shall not exceed 5 percent of total bid for the option.

I hereby certify that the above is a true and accurate tabulation of bids received at 2:00 p.m. (Central) on Tuesday, July 24, 2018, at the Department of Water Quality Control, 1860 S. Jefferson Avenue, Cookeville, TN 38506 for the Water Treatment Plant - 2018 Cleaning of Sludge Lagoons.

By  _____
 John L. King, P.E., Project Manager
 Tennessee License No. 103702
 CTI Engineers, Inc.
 112 Durwood Road, Suite A
 Knoxville, TN 37922